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INTRODUCTION

Many people are familiar with their own astrological Zodiac Sign because Sun Sign astrology is popular in
today’s culture. However, astrology is a complicated tradition and there is much more to the chart than just
the Zodiac Sign where the Sun resides. The Earth’s Moon, for example, is a powerful factor to help a person
gain greater understanding of a person’s nature, and so are the planets from Mercury out to Pluto. All of
these bodies, working through Zodiacal Signs, residing in sections of the sky called Houses, and interacting
with each other via angular relationships known as Aspects, create a birth chart which astrologers can
interpret.

In 1977 another body was added to the astrologer’s toolbox. Given the name Chiron (after the mythological
Centaur) by its discoverer, this minor planet adds another dimension to a person’s chart. It reveals a
person’s wounds, how to heal those that can be healed, and how to accept those that cannot. By exploring
Chiron in a person’s chart, the path to healing and becoming psychologically well is highlighted. Doors to a
larger perspective are revealed, and lessons are learned which enable you to teach others what you have
discovered.

The symbol for Chiron looks like a key. This is appropriate because Chiron is the key to many things
including to a new way of looking at things, to rising above problems and pain, to redemption if others have
been hurt, healing and forgiveness, finding a sense of belonging and to emotional truth, to name a few.

Chiron in the Chart, and therefore this report, shows us where we are most vulnerable to hurts, what will
ultimately comfort us, how to assimilate our pain, what we feel passionately about, our emotional truth and
how to share this truth with others. Chiron shows the beauty in each person’s journey towards emotional
truth and self-acceptance. The path may be painful but the journey is ultimately rewarding.

When exploring Chiron interpretations, please bear in mind that, inevitably, every chart will contain some
apparent contradictory influences, but this is because human beings themselves can have conflicting
thoughts, emotions, and desires active at the same time. Usually, an astrologer will synthesize these
apparent contradictions in order to present a cohesive and meaningful interpretation of the dilemmas of the
chart.

Please also be aware of the fact that each person may possess both positive and negative influences
arising from Chiron in their chart, and therefore in their lives. The challenge is to accept and overcome the
negative influences, so that you can successfully focus on manifesting the positive traits or qualities that are
inherent within their own personal chart. This report outlines the cosmic influences to better enable a person
to work towards achieving wholeness within one’s self. Advice given within this report is meant to encourage
the individual to accept responsibility for his or her own actions during a lifetime. Ultimately, the decision
rests with each individual.
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DOORWAYS TO UNDERSTANDING

Healing takes courage, and we all have courage, even if we have to dig a little to find it.
Tori Amos.

Chiron moves through the Zodiac Signs in an erratic manner and therefore it can reside in one Sign for an
extended period of time and in others for a shorter period. Nevertheless it does dwell in a Zodiac Sign for
some time and this means that you are likely to share your Chiron Sign with your peers. Positively this can
mean that you have empathy with your peers. The more that you understand the nature of Chiron in your
Zodiac Sign the more that you can understand how to express yourself in your peer groups. There is much
truth that can be gained from understanding Chiron’s Sign at the time of your birth. You can learn where you
are most vulnerable to hurts, what can be of comfort, how to assimilate any hurt feelings and how to share
this truth with others. The Sign can be the key to understanding opening doorways to connect with others.

Chiron is in Gemini
When you were born it is possible that your parents were concerned about problems that relate directly to
your Chiron Zodiac Sign. Something was preoccupying your parents’ minds. These could have been
personal or family challenges or related to world events.

Whatever the preoccupation the result was that you were affected by these concerns. In a way your child’s
mind becomes imprinted with the importance of these particular problems. You do not realize that you will
have to face other problems later, which may be of equal or greater importance. Since your parents (or
other role models) are so tense about what is going on at the time of your birth you become imprinted with
the concept that solving these problems is ‘priority one’.

You learn that nothing must stand in the way of resolving any difficulties in these areas. This then becomes
a deeply ingrained ‘personal imperative’, which stays with you and challenges you during your lifetime.

Communication for you becomes a personal imperative. It is especially important for you to understand the
reason why if there is ever a communication breakdown, or why there is an obstacle to communication.
Once you uncover the cause of the problem you then will feel compelled to resolve the situation.
Communication, rather than just words, is the imperative; you can develop skills at not just verbal
communication, but non-verbal as well, and learn to understand people from their gestures and body
language. Should you be misunderstood, it can hurt others intensely; bringing up old childhood hurts from
the subconscious if you haven’t made peace with them about times you were not understood in your youth.

On one level, you may have a nagging feeling that you are just not as smart as other people, or unable to
communicate as well, or just cannot get your ideas across as you would like. Perhaps you just felt as a
child that you were never really taken notice of. If the fear is strong enough, it could manifest either in you
remaining closed off and not even trying to communicate, or the opposite of talking too much just to be
heard, without really being sure you are saying anything worth listening to.



Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 2Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 3Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 4Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 5

You may need to work hard to hone your communication skills, to overcome your fears, as this Chiron
position is potentially one of the greatest communicators of the zodiac. It gives you the ability to
communicate things other people totally miss ideas that have been overlooked but are truly valuable;
missing pieces that pull other people’s ideas together and make a whole, clearer picture. It is from a
powerful imperative to find a way to truly communicate that you can become yourself, a master of words, a
teller of stories.

With communication so important, you are moved to be in contact with as many people as possible, and it
can be painful to lose contact with someone close to you. Another high priority for you is learning, and you
love to learn new ways of thinking, and new ways of problem-solving. You are always testing to see just
what limitations your immediate environment puts on you and on others as well.

Grounding is through the energies of understanding big ideas, especially from other people. Your Chiron
shows that you need to seek out ideas universally from religions and philosophies, from cultures in other
lands, and draw upon what you learn in order to give substance and value to your own ideas, and give
weight to your communications. The more you are able to clearly see that there are meaningful ideas from
all realms, the more grounded you may become, the more you are able to improve on your own ideas.
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WHERE IT BEGAN

The doctor is effective only when he himself is affected. Only the wounded physician heals.
Carl Jung.

The twelve divisions of the sky, known to astrologers as Houses, represent twelve areas of life, and the
House where Chiron is placed indicates the circumstances affecting your vulnerability. The life matters that
are shaped by this vulnerability give clues as to the direction you must take to begin the hero’s journey
towards healing.

Astrologers state that Saturn denotes basic lessons in life in the House it resides in. Where Chiron is
placed in a House describes how you will discover the lessons you need to learn. The affairs of Chiron’s
House have an element of ‘now’ to them; when a problem arises here the person cannot wait until later to
resolve it and nothing must stand in their way when they are trying to overcome obstacles here. The House
in which Chiron is placed is where the greatest focus for healing and becoming whole lies. By using the
positive energy as described by Chiron’s House position can help heal any problems that may be inherent
in the horoscope.

Chiron can act like a doorway to the basic energy force of the House itself, enabling a person to tap the
particular power inherent in the House under review, and use it almost without limit or restriction. In fact,
through Chiron’s House position a person can open doors to whole other realms, once opened, those doors
can never be closed again.

Chiron is in the 5th House
This placement can be connected with unique artistry and creativity, which is expressed in a sensitive and
soulful manner. You are one of a kind. You do not want your creativity to be influenced by anyone else. You
tend to be uninhibited and yet also sensitive. There is frequently an ‘anything goes’ attitude in the way you
express yourself. No rules govern your creativity, and your style is totally your own. You are the type of
person who will have a certain something that lives on after you have passed on. There is something so
totally unique about you that people know whom you are talking about when someone mentions this quality,
mannerism or creation of yours.

It is your inner child which carries your deepest wounds. One, or both, of your parents had low self-esteem.
Perhaps they did not truly value themselves. Growing up, you had to deal with this energy, as their low
self-worth expressed itself in the way they treated you. In one way or another, you picked up the message
that you also were worth very little (which hurt you deeply). The child within you was crippled, unable to
express itself uninhibitedly and it is from the inner child that one's creativity comes. Thus, you grew up with
an inner child very much wanting to express itself, yet it was buried deep within.

As a result, you have major lessons to learn about nurturing this inner child, and loving yourself. And as you
grow up, these lessons can come through the children that you are in contact with. Should you have
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children of your own then there will be something unique about them which brings these lessons home. It
may be that they have unique physical issues which demand that you devote more time to them than you
planned, or unique personality issues. In one way or another, you will have to face again the pains you
experienced growing up, and be called on to show the love and nurturing to the children in your life that you
did not experience as a child. These lessons will change your whole lifestyle, and as you heal, you will also
give yourself the right to express yourself, and your creativity will blossom.

There may also be major lessons to be learned through lovers, and there will be problems until you learn to
truly love that inner child. Basically, you cannot give of yourself to another until you can do so without
reservation. Your low self-esteem ties up all of that loving energy that needs to be shared in a relationship.
So you will learn how to love yourself more through interacting with lovers.

The major key with your wounds, in addition to learning to love your inner child, is to learn to forgive those
who hurt your younger self. Only by forgiving can you release yourself from all that binds you.

This position often creates the opportunity to add a whole new career after pursuing one career for many
years, yet frequently keep the old one as well. You have a strong competitive streak, lots of enthusiasm for
your field, and if you need to train for something you train hard. Many people with this position are known for
their sharp or caustic wit. There is often a strong bent towards trying to create a totally realistic style. You
are one of the true defenders of self-expression and freedom of thought.
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CONQUERING DRAGONS

A healer’s power stems not from any special ability, but from maintaining the courage and awareness to
embody and express the universal healing power that every human being naturally possesses.

Eric Micha’el Leventhal.

Planets interact based on angular relationships which astrologers call ‘Aspects’. These Aspects tell a story
of their own. Chiron’s Aspects show a person the specific cause of any wounding, and where they must turn
on the path to becoming whole, to face and defeat the inner dragons that are blocking the healing path.

Chiron is Square Mercury
You are a very original thinker, one-of-a-kind, a true innovator and proud of it. A wound, very early in life,
made you realize just how different your thinking was to those around you. You probably embraced this
discovery of being different and may even have felt happy about it.

The wound can cause you to stick to your conclusions rather than considering what other people have to
say and there are times when this actually is a negative trait. Sometimes your conclusions are right on, but
not always and you can have a blind spot about this.

As you heal, you will learn to listen, not only to your own logic, but also to that of others, and learn that at
times others may be right.

And you speak your mind! (Try to stop you!) Have you heard the song with the refrain, ‘I did it my way’? That
one is your theme song.

Some people love and admire you for your mind, and your words, but you have no trouble compiling lists of
the enemies you have made among people who are too easily offended. There is even a tendency in you to
try doing particular things just to disprove some statement that these things are impossible, cannot be done.

You can have a rather sharp wit, even a bit biting if you choose. Rarely do you find anyone with this aspect
who is not rather intelligent. You have an inner urge to learn more, find out more, and think more. Often,
when you were growing up, you had trouble sticking to certain lines of thinking, and discovering (sometimes
traumatically) that you had to change your thinking. Once you learn, through such forced changes, that your
mind must adapt, be willing to try new ways of thinking, you then relish trying new and experimental
approaches.

Chiron is Opposite Uranus
You part of a large group of people, a generation of individuals born between 1952 and 1989, and you were
all shaped by the changes that were going on around you. For example, there was an accelerated pace of
scientific advancement during the second half of the Twentieth Century. And part of the problem is that
science is making discoveries faster than they can be integrated into society; even faster than proper
safeguards can be devised for our protection from side effects and from the discoveries themselves.



Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 2Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 3Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 4Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 5Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 6Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 7Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 8Solar Writer Chiron - Harry, Prince of Wales Page 9

This same ‘vibration’ is, in many ways, a part of your nature. There is a thirst for the new, for discovery, for
experiences, that often outweighs the taking of any precautions. Others dare not try to curtail your freedom,
the consequences may not be pleasant. The urge for independence can be so strong that it can create
difficulties in relationships. The only relationships you can have that truly last is one where each person is
given a lot of space to be themselves, and in truth, it is difficult to find someone sufficiently secure to give a
partner that much freedom. It does give a real spirit, though.

The wound of the whole generation, though, can be summed up in the words, ‘fallen heroes’. For thousands
of years, people had heroes to worship, people to look up to as almost godlike. But this generation has seen
all of its heroes fall, or show very unheroic sides, or in one way or another, prove they are just like everyone
else. As a result, your generation has had a wound that each person must learn to heal in his/her own way,
but the lesson is to become one’s own hero to become the person you would like to look up to and respect.
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CONCLUSION

I always say a tremendous amount of healing is in your own hands.
Hayley Mills.

This report may give rise to some strong emotions. It may even stir up long-forgotten memories and colour
your dream life as you sleep. The purpose is to help you learn and as you learn the lessons of Chiron then
you see the world in new ways, follow your own unique path, and discover doors opening, doors that you did
not even realize were there. It is the guide to your personal quest.

In mythology, the Centaur Chiron was a teacher. He urged his pupils to gain wisdom and understanding.
When you understand Chiron in your Chart then you learn, grow, and see the world around you from a
larger perspective, ready to share the wisdom you have acquired to help others expand their horizons. You
can be a teacher, a mentor, a foster parent. You can help others to find the bridges to move from the past
into the future.

Chiron was also the father of the healing arts. As you learn Chiron's lessons in life you find your own path to
wholeness. With your clearer perspective you can take what you have learned through experience to help
heal others, helping guide them on their path to wholeness.

As you heal, Chiron gives you what are perhaps the three greatest gifts anyone could ask for. To
paraphrase the Serenity Prayer, you have the gift of being able to be at peace with the things you cannot
change; the gift of courage to change what can be changed; and the gift of wisdom to tell one from the
other.

About the Author: The text in this report has been written by astrologer Zane B Stein. Zane’s
ground-breaking book, “Essence and Application: A View from Chiron”, is one of the most widely read texts
on the subject. He is currently seeking to unravel the meaning of other Centaurean bodies,
trans-Neptunians, and some of the more unique asteroids.

In typical Gemini fashion, Zane has been active in a number of different careers. He has been involved with
astrology for more than 40 years. He has also worked as an IT Technical Support Specialist for the past 13
years, helping to solve software, hardware and internet problems. Zane has worked as a salesman,
designed websites, has a degree in hypnosis and has interviewed a number of noted show business
personalities for newspaper articles. Originally from the United States, he now has made Western Australia
his new home, where he has a private astrological practice. He and his astrologer wife Lynette have started
an astrological school in their home in Spearwood. Zane can be reached at Mr.Chiron@zanestein.com or
0452 524 387.

About the Artist: The illustrations have been created by artist, illustrator and teacher, Janet Bridgland. Janet
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divides her time between her home and garden in Bridgewater, overlooking the Heysen Trail, and working in
the second-hand bookshop Back Pages Books, in cosmopolitan Adelaide where she sells books, paints and
teaches watercolour painting and drawing. Her beautiful illustrative work can be discovered at:
www.janetbridgland.com.au

Please note that the author and publisher accept no liability for any adverse effects of this report.
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